

Item #6A - 23A Gravel

Company	Qty/Ton	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Grand Total	Terms	Delivery	Exceptions to Specifications
Pierce and Pitt Trucking	3,750	\$ 13.00	\$ 48,750.00	\$ 474,090.00	30 Days	As Needed	
	2,500	\$ 13.00	\$ 32,500.00				
	2,500	\$ 13.00	\$ 32,500.00				
	650	\$ 13.00	\$ 8,450.00				
	420	\$ 13.00	\$ 5,460.00				
	7,315	\$ 14.50	\$ 106,067.50				
	3,500	\$ 16.75	\$ 58,625.00				
	800	\$ 16.75	\$ 13,400.00				
	5,050	\$ 16.75	\$ 84,587.50				
	5,000	\$ 16.75	\$ 83,750.00				
Mark Martin & Sons	3,750	\$ 15.35	\$ 57,562.50	\$ 266,509.75	If awarded partial bid 1.5% discount If awarded full bid 3% discount Net 30 days	Included	
	2,500	\$ 15.35	\$ 38,375.00				
	2,500	\$ 15.35	\$ 38,375.00				
	650	\$ 15.25	\$ 9,912.50				
	420	\$ 15.10	\$ 6,342.00				
	7,315	\$ 15.85	\$ 115,942.75				
	3,500	No Bid					
	800	No Bid					
	5,050	No Bid					
	5,000	No Bid					
Green Dream International	3,750	\$ 29.72	\$ 111,450.00	\$ 928,046.40	Net 30	Within 2 days of order	None
	2,500	\$ 29.72	\$ 74,300.00				
	2,500	\$ 32.13	\$ 80,325.00				
	650	\$ 32.13	\$ 20,884.50				
	420	\$ 32.13	\$ 13,494.60				
	7,315	\$ 29.72	\$ 217,401.80				
	3,500	\$ 28.67	\$ 100,345.00				
	800	\$ 27.14	\$ 21,712.00				
	5,050	\$ 28.67	\$ 144,783.50				
	5,000	\$ 28.67	\$ 143,350.00				