
Genesee County Road Commission Purchasing Office

Bid Tabulations

Bid Date:  August 3, 2023

Pomp's Tire Shrader Tire Jerry's Tire Shrader Tire Rowleys

Description Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

700/750R16LT Tire Tube  $                         -   28.94$                 24.00$                28.94$                15.66$                 

10/12.80R20 Tube  $                         -   48.00$                 34.00$                48.00$                36.49$                 

10.00-16 Tire Tube  $                   25.00 32.69$                 34.00$                32.69$                187.02$               

11L15/16 Tire Tube  $                   25.00 32.94$                 34.00$                32.94$                104.94$               

Radial Tube  $                         -   No Bid 1.00$                  No Bid -$                     

ST175/80D13 Tire (Solar Arrow) LR-C  $                   45.00 92.60$                 62.35$                92.60$                37.89$                 

P235/75R15 Car Tire – LR-C  $                         -   126.53$               95.10$                126.53$              80.49$                 

8X14.5 Arrow Tires – LR-G  $                   85.00 134.98$               82.34$                134.98$              72.29$                 

16.9/18.4 R30 Tractor Tubes  $                   70.00 136.00$               75.00$                136.00$              65.06$                 

LT245/75R16 Mud & Snow Tire – LR-E  $                 139.51 205.00$               140.00$              198.20$              109.33$               

9.50/16.5LT Tire (Hot Patcher) – LR-E  $                 125.00 260.40$               247.05$              260.40$              -$                     

LT265/75R16 Transforce AT – LR-E  $                 151.35 269.00$               147.05$              208.55$              478.41$               

LT215/85R16 Tractor Steer Tire – LR-E  $                 115.92 140.50$               112.00$              249.94$              100.07$               

7.50R16 Tire (Hydroseeder) – LR-G  $                         -   145.21$               153.04$              145.21$              -$                     

215/85R16 Mud/Snow Tires – LR-E  $                 132.47 195.20$               146.27$              170.34$              100.07$               

9-14.5 HV Duty Loboy Tire (New Sweeper) – LR-F  $                   85.00 155.00$               138.82$              155.00$              104.14$               

1000-16 Tractor Front Steer Tires – F2 – LR-D  $                 165.00 260.00$               240.00$              260.00$              181.25$               

11R22.5 Rear Mud & Snow Tire – LR-G  $                 345.00 535.22$               513.71$              463.21$              344.31$               

11R-22.5 Front Steer Tire – LR-H  $                         -   569.29$               537.71$              452.86$              463.12$               

16.9-30 Tractor Tire – 6 Ply Super All Traction-23  $                 550.00 839.00$               705.00$              839.00$              541.04$               

235/80R16 - Hot Patcher Tire - LR-G  $                 165.00 195.00$               214.30$              195.00$              126.17$               

P245/70R17 - New Pickup Truck Tire (no load range)  $                 111.92 138.00$               149.34$              159.99$              100.99$               

10.00-20 Tire w/seal - LR-F  $                         -   No Bid 321.00$              No Bid 526.99$               

315/80R22.5 - Firestone Steer Tire - LR-L  $                         -   716.53$               595.29$              930.02$              -$                     

205/75R15 - Loadstart Tire  $                   60.00 96.00$                 95.31$                96.00$                65.06$                 

385/65R22.5 - Traction / Steer Tire LR-L  $                 602.78 765.98$               674.34$              842.74$              420.01$               

215/75r17.5 - Tractor Tire - LR-H  $                 185.00 378.00$               170.03$              378.00$              430.47$               

245/70R19.5 - Bridgestone Tire - LR-H  $                 334.69 535.58$               337.54$              421.61$              -$                     

LT235/85R/16  $                         -   195.68$               146.00$              182.28$              109.86$               

225/75/16  $                         -   136.00$               140.48$              136.00$              77.92$                 

18.4x3 -$                       993.00$               1.00$                  993.00$              639.37$               

12.4x24 260.00$                 498.00$               395.00$              498.00$              245.48$               

7.50-16 3-Rib Front Tractor Tire - 8 Ply Load Index 99 -$                       246.00$               160.00$              246.00$              -$                     

17.5R25 Loader Tire - Type 2-A 875.00$                 1,492.00$            1,235.00$           1,492.00$           941.00$               

245/75R/17E 120.00$                 223.00$               159.00$              208.55$              118.66$               

225/70/19.5 240.00$                 409.00$               313.32$              448.22$              132.87$               

ST205/75R14 -$                       102.89$               92.27$                102.89$              46.96$                 

215/75R14 -$                       105.89$               92.47$                105.89$              57.51$                 

265/70R17 100.00$                 169.00$               170.55$              187.06$              106.96$               

18.4R30 820.00$                 1,347.00$            775.00$              1,347.00$           639.37$               

225/70/R19 -$                       405.78$               1.00$                  390.84$              -$                     

245/75/R17 120.00$                 174.89$               120.78$              256.31$              118.66$               

245/75R16 96.00$                   169.00$               128.66$              172.73$              92.07$                 

215/75/R15 70.00$                   118.00$               153.98$              112.23$              63.48$                 

425/65/R22.5 660.00$                 1,070.00$            717.35$              954.32$              447.77$               

P265/70R17 Bridgestone Dueller AT RJS 113S m+s 132.45$                 297.00$               147.08$              297.00$              -$                     

320/85R24 AGRI Max BKT Tractor Tire (JD 4WD) 440.00$                 574.00$               395.00$              574.00$              447.77$               

326011 11L15 10PLY Industrial Spec (2WD) 190.00$                 252.00$               225.00$              252.00$              -$                     

7,642.09$              16,009.72$          11,648.53$         16,015.07$         8,976.98$            

Exceptions: See attached subs Orders must be 

$300 or more

See attached subs

VMI Item #74 - Tires

Prepared by:  

Stephanie Jaeger

Purchasing Administrator


