

Item #6 - Limestone

Company	Description	23A Modified Limestone			Ohio #2 Limestone		Exceptions
		Est. Qty	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Est. Qty	Unit Cost	
Stoneco of Michigan	Flint Garage	1,000	\$ 23.50	\$ 23,500.00	300	No Bid	
	Atlas Garage	6,000	\$ 25.20	\$ 151,200.00	100	No Bid	
	Linden Garage	8,000	\$ 25.60	\$ 204,800.00	300	No Bid	
	Metro Garage	6,000	\$ 22.00	\$ 132,000.00	300	No Bid	
	Montrose Garage	6,000	\$ 24.60	\$ 147,600.00	300	No Bid	
	Otisville Garage	6,000	\$ 24.60	\$ 147,600.00	300	No Bid	
	Swartz Creek Garage	8,000	\$ 24.30	\$ 194,400.00	300	No Bid	
				\$ 1,001,100.00			
Latigo Transport	Flint Garage	1,000	\$ 24.85	\$ 24,850.00	300	No Bid	
	Atlas Garage	6,000	\$ 26.20	\$ 157,200.00	100	No Bid	
	Linden Garage	8,000	\$ 26.95	\$ 215,600.00	300	No Bid	
	Metro Garage	6,000	\$ 24.35	\$ 146,100.00	300	No Bid	
	Montrose Garage	6,000	\$ 25.70	\$ 154,200.00	300	No Bid	
	Otisville Garage	6,000	\$ 25.80	\$ 154,800.00	300	No Bid	
	Swartz Creek Garage	8,000	\$ 25.70	\$ 205,600.00	300	No Bid	
				\$ 1,058,350.00			
Wirt Saginaw Stone Dock	Flint Garage	1,000	\$ 28.25	\$ 28,250.00	300	No Bid	
	Atlas Garage	6,000	\$ 29.75	\$ 178,500.00	100	No Bid	
	Linden Garage	8,000	\$ 29.50	\$ 236,000.00	300	No Bid	
	Metro Garage	6,000	\$ 27.50	\$ 165,000.00	300	No Bid	
	Montrose Garage	6,000	\$ 27.25	\$ 163,500.00	300	No Bid	
	Otisville Garage	6,000	\$ 27.50	\$ 165,000.00	300	No Bid	
	Swartz Creek Garage	8,000	\$ 28.75	\$ 230,000.00	300	No Bid	
				\$ 1,166,250.00			