Genesee County Road Commission

Prepared By:

Purchasing Office
Bid Tabulations

Bid Date: August 1, 2024

Item #97 - Equipment Rental

IDescription

MacAllister Rentals

United Rentals

Herc Rentals

Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
[Hour Allowance on Meter
Loader, Skid Steer (Model S130) $ 250.00 $ 74500 $ 152500 | % 308.00 $ 634.00 $2,160.00|$ 253.38 $ 623.15 $1,611.95
Loader, Skid Steer (Model S570) $ 26500 $ 775.00 $ 1,650.00 | $ 317.00 $ 895.00 $2,160.00 | $ 253.38 $ 623.15 $1,611.95
Auger Attachment for Skid Steer $ 150.00 $ 400.00 $ 1,00000|$ 41500 $ 913.00 $2,876.00|$ 107.12 $ 30488 $ 758.08
Auger Attachment (only) for Skid Steer $ 180.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,095.00|$ 107.00 $ 279.00 $ 716.00|$ 37.08 $ 12463 $ 303.85
Auger Bits - 8" & 12" w/ Attachment Rental $ 220.00 $ 550.00 $ 1,34500|$ 20.00 $ 3500 $ 80.00]|$% 3811 $ 13596 $ 305.91
Auger Bits - 18" w/ Attachment Rental $ 180.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,09500|$ 2000 $ 3500 $ 80.00|$ 4223 $ 15141 $ 316.21
Auger Bits - 24" w/ Attachment Rental $ 180.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,09500|$% 2000 $ 3500 $ 80.00|$ 4841 $ 15450 $ 364.62
IDoubIeAxIeTraiIerw/EquipmentRental $ 7000 $ 200.00 $ 550.00]% 73.00 $ 288.00 $ 540.00] NoBid No Bid No Bid
Double Axle Trailer Rental $ 7500 $ 22000 $ 63000|% 73.00 $ 288.00 $ 540.00|$ 13390 $ 379.04 $ 712.76
Asphalt Roller 3000# Class $ 230.00 $ 660.00 $ 1,450.00 | $ 231.00 $ 660.00 $1,562.00|$ 298.70 $ 730.27 $1,895.20
Single Axle Trailer w/ Equipment Rental $ 6500 $ 195.00 $ 400.00]$ 63.00 $ 200.00 $ 460.00| NoBid No Bid No Bid
Single Axle Trailer $ 70.00 $ 21500 $ 46500|% 63.00 $ 200.00 $ 460.00|$ 5253 $ 20085 $ 427.45
IPlow, Vibratory 410SX $ 325.00 $ 875.00 $ 2,050.00 | $ 220.00 $ 553.00 $1,377.00] NoBid No Bid No Bid
Mini Excavator 10' Cap, 18" or 24" Bucket $ 320.00 $ 905.00 $ 2,155.00 | $ 353.00 $ 943.00 $2,193.00|$% 16.00 $ 63.00 $ 115.00
4' Ditching Bucket $ 2500 $ 40.00 $ 100.00|$% 1600 $ 6300 $ 11500|$ 3296 $ 8034 $ 226.60
JHi-Flo Asphalt Mill for Skid Steer $ 68500 $ 1,395.00 $ 2,495.00|$ 616.00 $1,725.00 $2,905.00 | $ 499.55 $1,545.00 $2,755.25
Mini Excavator Thumb No Charge No Charge No Charge | $ - $ - $ - $ 5562 $ 15450 $ 454.23
TB285 Excavator $ 53500 $ 1,420.00 $ 3,405.00 | $ 545.00 $1,440.00 $3,348.00 | $ 530.45 $1,366.81 $3,605.00
Roller Trailer $ 7000 $ 21500 $ 465.00]% 63.00 $ 200.00 $ 460.00] NoBid No Bid No Bid
Equipment Delivery $175 Each Way $225 Each Way $175 Each Way
Exceptions: See equipment list - comparable models
Description Southeastern Equipment Co Alta Equipment

Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
IHour Allowance on Meter
Loader, Skid Steer (Model S130) $ 318.00 $ 952.00 $ 2,850.00 | $ 275.00 $ 833.00 $2,326.00
Loader, Skid Steer (Model S570) $ 318.00 $ 952.00 $ 2,850.00 | $ 338.00 $ 873.00 $2,443.00
Auger Attachment for Skid Steer $ 39600 $ 1,186.00 $ 3,550.00 | $ 410.00 $1,170.00 $3,361.00
Auger Attachment (only) for Skid Steer $ 7800 $ 23400 $ 700.00|$ 158.00 $ 360.00 $1,080.00
Auger Bits - 8" & 12" w/ Attachment Rental $ 2300 $ 67.00 $ 20000|$ 3000 $ 6500 $ 170.00
Auger Bits - 18" w/ Attachment Rental $ 2300 $ 67.00 $ 20000|$ 3000 $ 6500 $ 170.00
Auger Bits - 24" w/ Attachment Rental $ 2300 $ 67.00 $ 20000|$ 3000 $ 6500 $ 170.00
Double Axle Trailer w/ Equipment Rental N/A N/A N/A $ 50.00 $ 140.00 $ 300.00
Double Axle Trailer Rental N/A N/A N/A $ 100.00 $ 280.00 $ 600.00
Asphalt Roller 3000# Class $ 212.00 $ 634.00 $ 1,900.00 | $ 225.00 $ 600.00 $1,400.00
Single Axle Trailer w/ Equipment Rental N/A N/A N/A $ 50.00 $ 140.00 $ 300.00
Single Axle Trailer N/A N/A N/A $ 100.00 $ 280.00 $ 600.00
IPlow, Vibratory 410SX N/A N/A N/A $ 325.00 $ 805.00 $1,920.00
Mini Excavator 10' Cap, 18" or 24" Bucket $ 267.00 $ 800.00 $ 2,400.00 | $ 270.00 $ 770.00 $2,155.00
4' Ditching Bucket $ 2200 $ 66.00 $ 200.00|$ 50.00 $ 140.00 $ 300.00
JHi-Flo Asphalt Mill for Skid Steer $ 223.00 $ 667.00 $ 2,000.00 | $ 950.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
Mini Excavator Thumb $ 4500 $ 75.00 $ 225.00 0 0 0
TB285 Excavator $ 340.00 $ 1,020.00 $ 3,060.00 | $ 400.00 $1,000.00 $2,800.00
Roller Trailer N/A N/A N/A NA NA NA
Equipment Delivery $175/hour Flat Rate $300 / Hourly Rate $125
Exceptions: See attached Flat rate is per truckload.

Stephanie Jaeger, Purchasing Administrator




