

Item #16E - Carbide Cutting Edge Blades

Company Name	Item Description	Price Per Foot	Price Each	Delivery	Exceptions
Winter Equipment Company	Kennametal I.C.E. Blades 7/8" x 5" x 48"	\$ 74.00	\$ 296.00	10-14 days Guards	Complete Kit - Unit price includes bolt kit Price valid 2 years No charge freight
	Carbide Curb Guards				
	Left Side		\$ 183.31	90-120 days	
	Right Side		\$ 189.00	ICE Blade	
	Complete Kit		\$ 394.31		
Truck & Trailer Specialties	Kennametal I.C.E. Blades 7/8" x 5" x 48"	\$ 107.19	\$ 428.76	7-10 days	Must place a minimum order of \$10,000.00 2nd year price increase of 3%
	Carbide Curb Guards				
	Left Side				
	Right Side				
	Complete Kit				
Viking Cives Great Lakes	Kennametal I.C.E. Blades 7/8" x 5" x 48"	\$ 109.72	\$ 438.88	3-4 weeks	
	Carbide Curb Guards				
	Left Side		\$ 222.67		
	Right Side		\$ 222.67		
	Complete Kit		\$ 445.34		
Wear Parts & Equipment	Kennametal I.C.E. Blades 7/8" x 5" x 48"	\$ 133.99	\$ 535.96	6 weeks	Kennametal has discontinued 8" tall guard. Only quoting a reversible 6" version. 1. Pricing firm for 90 days. Will confirm pricing for orders after this date for up to two years if there are no significant manufacturing price increases. 2. Lead time varies depending on quantity requested. Current lead time is six weeks, subject to change. 3. No minimum order.
	Carbide Curb Guards				
	Left Side		\$ 278.88		
	Right Side		\$ 278.88		
	Complete Kit		\$ 557.76		
Ina Store	Kennametal I.C.E. Blades 7/8" x 5" x 48"		\$ 723.38	Truck freight from supplier	Finance Charge & Sales Tax note - see attached.
	Carbide Curb Guards				
	Left Side		\$ 273.73		
	Right Side		\$ 273.73		
	Complete Kit		\$ 547.46		
Valk Manufacturing		No Bid	No Bid		
St. Regis Culvert		No Bid	No Bid		