

Lubricants								
Company Name	Gen Oil Company		Lyden Oil Company		Rowleys		Shrader Tire & Oil	
	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost
<b>Item #2 - Antifreeze</b>								
1	Final Charge Global Yellow ( 1Gal)		Peak	\$ 8.79	Peak Svc Pro	\$ 4.07	Peak	\$ 9.85
2	Final Charge Global Yellow ( Bulk)		Peak	\$ 9.75	Peak Svc Pro	\$ 3.52	Peak	\$ 8.60
3	Pink for RV & Marine (1Gal)		Old-World	N/A	Tech Group	\$ 2.85	Superflite	\$ 4.99
4	Pink for RV & Marine (Drum)		Old-World	\$ 3.59	Tech Group	\$ 3.25	Superflite	\$ 6.67
<b>Item #10 - Gear Lubricant</b>								
5	Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (5 Gal)		Proguard	\$ 8.99	Purus	\$ 9.11	Chevron	\$ 15.18
6	Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 7.75	Purus	\$ 7.39	Chevron	\$ 13.28
<b>Item #11 - Hydraulic Oil</b>								
7	AW-32 (5 Gal Container)		Proguard	\$ 7.25	Purus	\$ 7.99	Chevron	\$ 10.81
8	AW-32 (1 Gal Container)		N/A	N/A	Purus	\$ 7.99	No Bid	
9	AW-32 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 5.55	Purus	\$ 6.20	Chevron	\$ 8.91
10	AW-32 (55 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 6.20	Purus	\$ 6.45	Chevron	\$ 9.73
11	AW-46 (5 Gal)		Proguard	\$ 7.18	Purus	\$ 6.96	Chevron	\$ 10.81
12	AW-46 (55 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 6.50	Purus	\$ 6.45	Chevron	\$ 9.73
13	AW-46 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 5.55	Purus	\$ 6.20	Chevron	\$ 8.91
<b>Item #12 - Motor Oil 10W30</b>								
14	10W30 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 6.50	Service Pro	\$ 9.27	Chevron	\$ 14.08
<b>Item #13 - Motor Oil 15W40</b>								
15	15W40 (1 Gal Container)		N/A	N/A	Purus	\$ 12.13	Chevron	\$ 18.54
16	15W40 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 8.85	Purus	\$ 8.30	Chevron	\$ 10.92
17	15W40 (55 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 9.50	Purus	\$ 10.60	Chevron	\$ 11.74
<b>Item #14 - ATF</b>								
18	Dexos Mer III (Bulk)		Proguard Vintage	\$ 7.75	Service Pro	\$ 8.01	Chevron	\$ 12.43
19	Multi Vehicle Dexron VI/Mercon LV		Gulf	\$ 12.19	Service Pro	\$ 11.63	Chevron	\$ 28.97
20	ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)		N/A	N/A	Shell	\$ 6.29	Starfire	\$ 4.26
21	Dexos I, 5W30 Bulk (Gal)		Gulf	\$ 10.45	Service Pro	\$ 9.02	Starfire	\$ 10.34
<b>Item #32 - Transmission/DT Oil</b>								
22	SAE 10,30,50 (5 Gal Container)		Phillips 66	see attached	Purus	see sheet	Chevron	see attachment
23	SAE 10,30,50 (Bulk)		Phillips 66	see attached	Purus	see sheet	Chevron	see attachment
24	Hydraulic Oil AW-46 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 5.55	Purus	\$ 6.20	Chevron	see attachment
<b>Item #52 - Motor Oil Full/Blend Syn.</b>								
25	5W-30 Full Synthetic (Quart)		N/A	N/A	Service Pro	\$ 3.29	Starfire	\$ 6.02
26	5W-30 Full Synthetic (Bulk)		Gulf	\$ 10.36	Service Pro	\$ 9.11	Starfire	\$ 19.34
27	Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (55 Gal)		Proguard	\$ 6.75	Service Pro	\$ 6.82	Starfire	\$ 8.09
28	Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 6.00	Service Pro	\$ 6.67	Starfire	\$ 7.25
<b>Item #53 - Transmission Oil</b>								
29	ATF Transynd (5 Gal)		Citgo	\$ 27.10	Purus	\$ 26.16	Chevron	\$ 33.27
30	ATF Transynd (1 Gal)		N/a	N/A	Petro	\$ 31.15	No Bid	
31	ATF Transynd (Bulk)		Citgo	\$ 24.10	Purus	\$ 26.16	Chevron	\$ 31.37
32	Dexron III - ATF (55 Gal)		Proguard Vintage	\$ 8.70	Service Pro	\$ 8.45	Chevron	\$ 13.26
33	Multi Vehicle Dexron VI/Mercon LV		Gulf	\$ 13.50	Service Pro	\$ 12.21	Chevron	\$ 20.09
34	ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)		N/A	N/A	Shell	\$ 6.29	Starfire	\$ 4.26
<b>Item #54 - Full Synthetic Gear Lube</b>								
35	50W (5 Gal Container)		Proguard	\$ 12.25	Service Pro	\$ 17.99	Starfire	\$ 3.25/lb
36	75W90 (5 Gal Container)		Proguard	\$ 20.99	Service Pro	\$ 18.10	Starfire	\$ 3.14/lb
37	75W90 (Bulk)		Proguard	\$ 2.60 / lb	Service Pro	\$ 15.87	Starfire	\$ 3.06/lb
38	75W90 (16 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 22.65	Service Pro	\$ 19.40	Starfire	\$ 3.27/lb
39	85W140 (16 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 23.93	Service Pro	\$ 14.18	Starfire	\$ 2.43/lb
<b>Item #55 - Windshield Washer Fluid</b>								
40	1 Gal Container		Proguard	\$ 2.25	Kleer View	\$ 1.99	Peak	\$ 3.17
41	55 Gallon Barrel		Proguard	\$ 2.45	Service Pro	\$ 1.74	Peak	\$ 3.06
<b>Item #56 - Grease, Chassis</b>								
43	#221 Moly Ultra EP (55 Gal Barrel)		Proguard	\$ 28.29	Purus	\$ 18.22	No Bid	
44	#221 Moly Ultra EP (120# Cont.)		Proguard	\$ 19.53	Purus	\$ 20.30	No Bid	
45	#221 Moly Ultra EP (Tube)		Proguard	\$ 3.99	Purus	\$ 2.08	No Bid	
<b>Item #71 - Synthetic DT Oil</b>								
46	SAE OW-20 (Drum)		Phillips 66	\$ 1,469.60	Purus	\$ 522.40	Chevron	\$ 1,989.90
47	SAE OW-20 (5 Gallon Pails)		N/A	N/A	Purus	\$ 10.84	No Bid	
48	SAE OW-20 (Bulk)		Phillips	\$ 24.97	Purus	\$ 8.93	No Bid	
<b>Item #72 - Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)</b>								
49	DEF (55 Gal Drum)	Kleen DEF \$ 2.30		\$ 3.09	Purus	\$ 1.65	Blue Sky	\$ 3.27

Lubricants								
Company Name	Safety-Kleen Systems		Marathon Flint		Corrigan Oil		Super-Flite Oil	
	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost
<b>Item #2 - Antifreeze</b>								
1 Final Charge Global Yellow ( 1Gal)	Peak				Peak	\$ 10.18	Peak	\$ 13.50
2 Final Charge Global Yellow ( Bulk)	Peak	\$ 4.54			Peak	\$ 9.77	Peak	\$ 7.49
3 Pink for RV & Marine (1Gal)					Frigid Guard	\$ 4.24	Frigid Gard	\$ 3.79
4 Pink for RV & Marine (Drum)		\$ 10.82			Frigid Guard	\$ 4.71	Frigid Gard	\$ 3.50
<b>Item #10 - Gear Lubricant</b>								
5 Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (5 Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 8.70			Catstrol	\$ 12.49	CAM2	\$ 7.85
6 Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 8.40			Castrol	\$ 10.27	CAM2	\$ 7.45
<b>Item #11 - Hydraulic Oil</b>								
7 AW-32 (5 Gal Container)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.30			Corrigan	\$ 9.06	CAM2	\$ 6.45
8 AW-32 (1 Gal Container)	Performance Plus				N/A		CAM2	\$ 9.65
9 AW-32 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 6.00			Corrigan	\$ 5.53	CAM2	\$ 5.75
10 AW-32 (55 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.00			Corrigan	\$ 6.41	CAM2	\$ 6.63
11 AW-46 (5 Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.30			Corrigan	\$ 9.18	CAM2	\$ 6.45
12 AW-46 (55 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.00			Corrigan	\$ 6.53	CAM2	\$ 6.72
13 AW-46 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.00			Corrigan	\$ 5.65	CAM2	\$ 5.85
<b>Item #12 - Motor Oil 10W30</b>								
14 10W30 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 9.20			Corrigan	\$ 10.26		
<b>Item #13 - Motor Oil 15W40</b>								
15 15W40 (1 Gal Container)	Performance Plus	\$ 11.81			Castrol	\$ 18.93	CAM2	\$ 12.65
16 15W40 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 9.20			Castrol	\$ 9.99	CAM2	\$ 8.50
17 15W40 (55 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plus	\$ 9.19			Castrol	\$ 10.99	CAM2	\$ 9.45
<b>Item #14 - ATF</b>								
18 Dexos Mer III (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 8.67			Corrigan	\$ 9.22	CAM2	\$ 7.25
19 Multi Vehicle Dexron VI /Mercon LV	Performance Plus	\$ 12.35			Corrigan	\$ 12.73	CAM2	\$ 12.25
20 ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)	Pennzoil	\$ 6.77			Castrol	\$ 6.39	CAM2	\$ 4.90
21 Dexos I, 5W30 Bulk (Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 9.25			Corrigan	\$ 10.62	Maxximum	\$ 9.65
<b>Item #32 - Transmission/DT Oil</b>								
22 SAE 10,30,50 (5 Gal Container)	See attached	see attached			Corrigan	see sheet	CAM2	\$ 11.75
23 SAE 10,30,50 (Bulk)	See attached	see attached			Corrigan	see sheet	CAM2	\$ 9.50
24 Hydraulic Oil AW-46 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.00			Corrigan	\$ 5.65	CAM2	\$ 5.80
<b>Item #52 - Motor Oil Full/Blend Syn.</b>								
25 5W-30 Full Synthetic (Quart)	Performance Plus	\$ 2.73			Castrol	\$ 6.16	Maxximum	\$ 3.45
26 5W-30 Full Synthetic (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 9.25			Corrigan	\$ 10.62	Maxximum	\$ 9.65
27 Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (55 Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.18			Corrigan	\$ 8.06	CAM2	\$ 10.54
28 Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 7.25			Corrigan	\$ 7.18	CAM2	\$ 6.25
<b>Item #53 - Transmission Oil</b>								
29 ATF Transynd (5 Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 20.00			Castrol	\$ 32.35	Citgo	\$ 32.00
30 ATF Transynd (1 Gal)	Performance Plus				Castrol	\$ 35.41	Citgo	\$ 33.50
31 ATF Transynd (Bulk)	Performance Plus	\$ 19.73			Castrol	\$ 29.95	Citgo	\$ 27.99
32 Dexron III - ATF (55 Gal)	Performance Plus	\$ 8.67			Corrigan	\$ 10.72	CAM2	\$ 8.18
33 Multi Vehicle Dexron VI /Mercon LV	Performance Plus	\$ 12.32			Corrigan	\$ 12.73	CAM2	\$ 13.09
34 ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)	Pennzoil	\$ 81.24			Castrol	\$ 6.39	CAM2	\$ 4.90
<b>Item #54 - Full Synthetic Gear Lube</b>								
35 50W (5 Gal Container)	Performance Plu:	\$ 22.46			Corrigan	\$ 31.53	CAM2	\$ 27.50
36 75W90 (5 Gal Container)	Performance Plu:	\$ 18.60			Corrigan	\$ 23.53	CAM2	\$ 25.50
37 75W90 (Bulk)	Performance Plus				Corrigan	\$ 20.59	CAM2	\$ 16.50
38 75W90 (16 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plu:	\$ 20.78			Corrigan	\$ 23.53	CAM2	\$ 20.65
39 85W140 (16 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plus				Corrigan	\$ 14.68	CAM2	\$ 12.95
<b>Item #55 - Windshield Washer Fluid</b>								
40 1 Gal Container					Corrigan	\$ 2.24	Kleen-View	\$ 2.22
41 55 Gallon Barrel	Performance Plu:	\$ 3.38			Corrigan	\$ 3.24	Choice WWS	\$ 2.03
<b>Item #56 - Grease, Chassis</b>								
43 #221 Moly Ultra EP (55 Gal Barrel)	Performance Plu:	\$ 50.39			Castrol	\$ 41.10	CAM2	\$ 24.50
44 #221 Moly Ultra EP (120# Cont.)					Castro	\$ 42.98	CAM2	\$ 27.90
45 #221 Moly Ultra EP (Tube)	Performance Plu:	\$ 75.68			Castrol	\$ 6.38	CAM2	\$ 3.94
<b>Item #71 - Synthetic DT Oil</b>								
46 SAE OW-20 (Drum)	Performance Plu:	\$ 568.33			Castrol	\$ 1,330.45	Maxximum	\$ 580.00
47 SAE OW-20 (5 Gallon Pails)	Performance Plu:	\$ 13.03			Castrol	\$ 27.82	Maxximum	\$ 11.85
48 SAE OW-20 (Bulk)	Performance Plu:	\$ 10.34			Castrol	\$ 23.78	Maxximum	\$ 9.65
<b>Item #72 - Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)</b>								
49 DEF (55 Gal Drum)	Blue	\$ 4.27	Musket	\$ 2.89	Blue Cap	\$ 2.55	Kleen DEF	\$ 2.27

## Lubricants

Company Name	Eastern Oil		Eastern Oil (HVI)		Atlantic Petroleum	
	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost	Brand Name	Unit Cost
<b>Item #2 - Antifreeze</b>						
1	Final Charge Global Yellow ( 1Gal)				Peak	\$ 34.89
2	Final Charge Global Yellow ( Bulk)				Peak	\$ 10.43
3	Pink for RV & Marine (1Gal)					\$ 6.84
4	Pink for RV & Marine (Drum)					\$ 11.55
<b>Item #10 - Gear Lubricant</b>						
5	Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (5 Gal)	Eastern Universa \$ 10.154			Marathon	\$ 7.68
6	Allison C-4 Tractor Fluid (Bulk)	Eastern Universa \$ 7.41			Marathon	\$ 8.96
<b>Item #11 - Hydraulic Oil</b>						
				HVI		
7	AW-32 (5 Gal Container)	Eastern Premiur \$ 8.498	Eastern Premiur \$ 9.35		Marathon	\$ 10.02
8	AW-32 (1 Gal Container)				Marathon	\$ 19.25
9	AW-32 (Bulk)	Eastern Premiur \$ 5.76	Eastern Premiur \$ 6.61		Marathon	\$ 10.14
10	AW-32 (55 Gal Barrel)	Eastern Premiur \$ 6.856	Eastern Premiur \$ 7.708		Marathon	\$ 11.80
11	AW-46 (5 Gal)	Eastern Premiur \$ 8.356	Eastern Premiur \$ 9.52		Marathon	\$ 10.63
12	AW-46 (55 Gal Barrel)	Eastern Premiur \$ 6.894	Eastern Premiur \$ 7.877		Marathon	\$ 11.98
13	AW-46 (Bulk)	Eastern Premiur \$ 5.79	Eastern Premiur \$ 6.78		Marathon	\$ 10.14
<b>Item #12 - Motor Oil 10W30</b>						
14	10W30 (Bulk)				Marathon	11 17/20
<b>Item #13 - Motor Oil 15W40</b>						
15	15W40 (1 Gal Container)				Marathon	\$ 19.88
16	15W40 (Bulk)				Marathon	\$ 11.92
17	15W40 (55 Gal Barrel)				Marathon	\$ 11.86
<b>Item #14 - ATF</b>						
18	Dexos Mer III (Bulk)				Motorcraft	\$ 23.90
19	Multi Vehicle Dexron VI /Mercon LV				Motorcraft	\$ 23.10
20	ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)				Motorcraft	\$ 18.33
21	Dexos I, 5W30 Bulk (Gal)				Motorcraft	\$ 21.54
<b>Item #32 - Transmission/DT Oil</b>						
22	SAE 10,30,50 (5 Gal Container)				Marathon	\$ 15.64
23	SAE 10,30,50 (Bulk)				Marathon	\$ 15.27
24	Hydraulic Oil AW-46 (Bulk)				Marathon	\$ 10.14
<b>Item #52 - Motor Oil Full/Blend Syn.</b>						
25	5W-30 Full Synthetic (Quart)				Motorcraft	\$ 19.21
26	5W-30 Full Synthetic (Bulk)				Motorcraft	\$ 22.98
27	Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (55 Gal)				Motorcraft	\$ 20.09
28	Semi Synthetic 5W-30 (Bulk)				Motorcraft	\$ 22.73
<b>Item #53 - Transmission Oil</b>						
29	ATF Transynd (5 Gal)				Castrol	\$ 45.00
30	ATF Transynd (1 Gal)				Castrol	\$ 45.01
31	ATF Transynd (Bulk)				Castrol	\$ 41.74
32	Dexron III - ATF (55 Gal)				Castrol	\$ 16.27
33	Multi Vehicle Dexron VI /Mercon LV				Castrol	\$ 6.80
34	ATF+4, Full Synthetic ATF (Qt)				Castrol	\$ 13.80
<b>Item #54 - Full Synthetic Gear Lube</b>						
35	50W (5 Gal Container)				Marathon	\$ 18.45
36	75W90 (5 Gal Container)				Marathon	\$ 18.64
37	75W90 (Bulk)				Marathon	\$ 36.19
38	75W90 (16 Gal Barrel)				Marathon	\$ 30.06
39	85W140 (16 Gal Barrel)				Marathon	\$ 30.69
<b>Item #55 - Windshield Washer Fluid</b>						
40	1 Gal Container				Johnsten	\$ 6.91
41	55 Gallon Barrel				Johnsten	\$ 5.84
<b>Item #56 - Grease, Chassis</b>						
43	#221 Moly Ultra EP (55 Gal Barrel)	Eastlube EP2 \$ 18.65				\$ 18.64
44	#221 Moly Ultra EP (120# Cont.)	Eastlube EP2 \$24.14/ga(keg)				\$ 19.34
45	#221 Moly Ultra EP (Tube)					\$ 9.25
<b>Item #71 - Synthetic DT Oil</b>						
46	SAE OW-20 (Drum)					\$ 20.05
47	SAE OW-20 (5 Gallon Pails)					\$ 37.80
48	SAE OW-20 (Bulk)					\$ 15.00
<b>Item #72 - Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)</b>						
49	DEF (55 Gal Drum)					\$ 4.16